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dere, ‘‘to kill oneself’’) (Kumar et al.,
2013). It may be positive or negative. Sui-
cide is a positive act when one takes one's
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ABSTRACT

Suicide among Egyptians is a subject of great concern which requires thorough study to for-

mulate a prevention strategy. The aim of this work was to study the magnitude of the problem of

suicide in Alexandria. The study entailed two parts: retrospective part and prospective one. The

data of retrospective study was retrieved from the medico-legal reports of cases of suicidal

death referred to the Directorate of Forensic Medicine in Alexandria for autopsy during a peri-

od of four years starting from 1st of January 2008 till the end of December 2011. The prospec-

tive study included all cases of suicidal death referred to the Directorate of Forensic Medicine

in Alexandria for autopsy during a period of six months, starting from 1st of January 2012 till

the end of June 2012. The results revealed that the total number of cases was 205, 11.5% of au-

topsied cases during the period of the study were suicidal with the highest percentage of cases

was recorded in 2010 (15.1%). The rate of suicidal deaths ranged from 0.88 to 1.09/100,000

population. The majority was males (75.6%), high prevalence (49.3%) was found in age group

21-30 years in both sexes. The prevalence was higher in urban (94.1%), educated (88.8%), un-

employed (57.1%) and unmarried (49.3%). Hanging was the most common method of suicide in

males (45.16%), while falling from height was the commonest method used by females (36%).

The majority of suicidal deaths occurred in spring (36.1%), and indoors (65.9%). Psychological

problems were reported in 38% and history of previous suicidal attempts was present in 20% of

cases. Conclusion: Suicide rate in Alexandria is much lower than in other areas but still consid-

ered a problem and should be given high priority with regard to prevention. Methods used to

commit suicide are widely available and are difficult to restrict. Therefore, suicide prevention

strategy based on risk factors could be more effective rather than limiting the access to methods.

Keywords: Suicide, Medicolegal study, Alexandria.



Sherif et al ...
30  

Mansoura J. Forensic Med. Clin. Toxicol. Vol. XXII,  No. 2,  July  2014

Egypt.

SUBJECTS AND METHODS

The study entailed two parts: a retro-
spective part and a prospective one. The
data of retrospective study was retrieved
from the medico-legal reports of cases of
suicidal death referred to the Directorate
of Forensic Medicine in Alexandria for au-
topsy during a period of four years start-
ing from 1st of January 2008 till the end of
December 2011. The prospective study in-
cluded all cases of suicidal death referred
to the Directorate of Forensic Medicine in
Alexandria for autopsy over six months
starting from 1st of January 2012 till the
end of June 2012. The total number of sui-
cidal cases during the whole period of
study was 205 (177 in retrospective & 28 in
prospective study). Doubtful cases regard-
ing manner of death were excluded from
the series. All deceased individuals in-
cluded in the current study were Egyp-
tians. Demographic data and personal his-
tory were recorded for all cases (age, sex,
marital status, residence, education, em-
ployment, place, season and method of
suicide, history of psychological troubles,
drug or alcohol abuse, menses in females,
previous suicidal attempts and presence
of suicidal note). In addition, results of fo-
rensic examination were also recorded for
each case, including presence of associated
injuries, signs of severe illness or sexual or
physical abuse and toxicological laborato-

own life. Suicide is a negative act when
one does not do what is necessary to es-
cape death such as leaving a burning
building (Franzese, 2009).

Suicide is one of the top ten causes of
death for individuals of all ages in most
developed countries (Ernst et al., 2007).
Global suicide rates have shown a steady
increase over the last 50 years and are pro-
jected to increase to 1.53 million by the
year 2020 (WHO, 2001). It is believed that
the most dramatic increase in suicide mor-
tality will be observed in the Third World
countries because the socioeconomic and
behavioral factors of suicide risk  are
present  in  a higher  degree  than in devel-
oped countries (Diekestra, 1991). The most
important problem in Egypt  is that there
is no  data  bank  for  suicide cases. This
causes the suicide problem to be underes-
timated,  although  this problem seems  to
be universal (Abdel Moneim et al., 2011).
The last data found regarding  suicide
rates in  Egypt,  according to the WHO
(2011) was in 1987.

There is paucity of research on suicide
from developing countries. Very little is
known about suicides in many Middle
Eastern, African and South American
countries. Without good accurate informa-
tion, prevention programs cannot be de-
veloped (Khan, 2005). So, the aim of the
present work is to study the magnitude of
the problem of suicide in Alexandria,
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RESULTS

Rate of suicidal cases were demonstrat-
ed in table (1). 11.5% of autopsied cases
during the study period were suicidal,
with the highest percentage recorded in
year 2010 (15.1%) followed by year 2009
(12.4%) and the least was 9.5% in 2008. Ta-
ble (2) illustrated a fluctuating trend of
suicide in Alexandria governorate along
the studied years. The rate of suicide
ranged from 0.88 to 1.09/100,000 popula-
tion, with an average rate of 1.02/100,000
population.

ry results. The study protocol was ap-
proved by the ethical committee of Alex-
andria, Faculty of Medicine.

Statistical analysis:
Statistical analysis was done using the

SPSS software package version 20 to ob-
tain mean and standard deviation. Chi
square test was used to study significant
association between two qualitative vari-
ables. P value < 0.05 was considered statis-
tically significant (Kirkpatrick and Feeney,
2013).

Table (1) : Distribution of autopsied and suicidal cases during the years of the study.

Table (2) : Suicidal rates in Alexandria during the studied years (2008-2012) in relation to num-
ber of Alexandria population. 

(1)Alexandria population according to (www. capmas.gov.eg).
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years as shown in figure (1). The mean age
of cases was 30.73±10.43 years. There was
no statistically significant difference be-
tween males and females regarding age
(P> 0.05).

Table (3) illustrated age and sex distri-
bution of suicidal cases. 75.6 % were males
(n=155) and 24.4% were females (n=50),
with male to female sex ratio of 3.1: 1.
Males outnumbered females in all studied

Table (3) : Age comparison between male and female suicidal cases in Alexandria governorate
(n= 205).

Figure (1) : Distribution of suicidal cases according to gender over the studied years.

those in age group from 31-40 years. There
was no statistically significant difference
between males and females regarding age
groups. 

Figures (2 & 3) showed that the highest
frequency of suicide in all studied years
was among those in the 3rd decade of life
which accounted for 49.3%, followed by
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Figure (2) : Distribution of suicidal cases according to age groups and gender.

Figure (3) : Distribution of suicidal cases according to age groups per year.

of suicide. Regarding menstrual history,
20% of females (n=10) had menses while
committing suicide. 

Table (4) demonstrated the sociodemo-
graphic data regarding marital status, resi-
dence, education, employment and place
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Table (4) : Distribution of suicidal cases in Alexandria governorate (n= 205) regarding
the socio-demographic data.

through winter and summer (26.8% and
20.5% respectively), to reach 16.6% % in
autumn . 

Figure (4) showed that the highest per-
centage of cases (36.1%) occurred during
spring, then percentage decreased

Figure (4) : Distribution of suicidal cases according to seasons of the year.
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Methods of suicide in relation to age
and gender were presented in  table (5)
and  figure (6). Table (5) showed that
hanging  was the commonest  method
used  for  committing  suicide  in  all  age
groups  except  the  age  group  from  70-
80   years,  which  included  one  case
committed  suicide  by burning.  Further-
more, hanging, falling  from  height and
burn were the only methods used by vic-
tims in age groups  above  50  years. There
was no statistical  significant  association
between age  group of  the  studied  cases
and  the method   of   suicide,  where
P=0.61.

The methods of suicide were shown in
figure (5). The highest percentage of cases
(35.1%) committed suicide by hanging, fol-
lowed by falling from height and burning
(19.5% & 19% respectively). Suicide by self
poisoning accounted for 12.2% of cases
(n=25); 15 of them were males and 10 were
females. They used 12 different types of
poisons, nine cases used organophosphate
rodenticide, four cases used carbamate in-
secticide, two cases used chlorinated in-
secticides, two cases used butane gas and
eight cases used the following poisons (io-
dine, chlorox, tramadol, heroin, imipra-
mine, amitriptyline, metoclopramide,
strychnine).

Figure (5) : Distribution of suicidal cases according to methods of suicide.
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Table (5) : Relation between age groups and methods of suicide.

males did not use neither drowning nor
car accident as a method of suicide. The
commonest method used by males was
hanging (n=70), while the highest percent-
age of females committed suicide by fall-
ing from height (36%) as seen in figure (6).

There was a highly statistical significant
relation between gender and the methods
of suicide, where X2= 42.01, P=0.0001.
Males constituted 97.2% of cases of hang-
ing, 85.7% of firearm cases and 90.9% of
suicide by incised wounds. Moreover, fe-
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Figure (6) : Relation between gender and methods of suicide among the studied cases
(n=205).

Table (7) showed the results of studied
samples taken from suicide victims, 78.5%
of them had negative results, while 21.5%
had positive results. The highest percent-
age were positive for toxins (11.7%), fol-
lowed by alcohol (4.4%), then drugs (2.9%)
and flammable material (2.4%). 

The current study revealed that psychic
troubles were present in 38% of cases of
suicide (n=78), while they were absent in
127 cases (62%).  Table (6) showed that
12.7% of the cases had history of alcohol
abuse and 10.2% of cases had history of
drug abuse. 

Table (6) : Distribution of the studied suicidal cases in Alexandria governorate
(n=205) regarding the history of drug and alcohol abuse.
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abuse, tables (9 &10) demonstrated that
signs of sexual abuse were present in 1.5%
of suicide victims (n=3), all of them were
females. Moreover, signs of physical abuse
were present in 5.4% of suicide victims
(n=11), the majority (90.9%) of them were
females (n=10). There were statistical sig-
nificant differences between males and fe-
males regarding presence of sexual or
physical abuse where P= 0.014 and 0.000
respectively. 

Table  (9)  illustrated  that  signs  of  se-
vere  illness  were  present  in  3.9%  of
suicide  victims  ( n=8 ). They  were  suf-
fering  from   severe   physical  illness
(like advanced  malignancy,  miliary  TB,
severe  rheumatoid   arthritis,  epilepsy,
liver  cirrhosis,   peptic  ulcer,  interstitial
lung  fibrosis,  and  chronic  renal   fail-
ure). 

The present study showed that 20% of
suicide victims had previous suicide at-
tempts (n=41).  Suicidal note was present
in 3.4% of suicide cases of the current
study. Table (8) showed that there was no
statistical significant association between
presence of suicidal note and method of
suicide (X2=9.6, P= 0.21).

Data related to forensic examination
(Tables 9 & 10):

As illustrated in table (9), the associated
injuries are present in 10.7% of the studied
cases. They included recent injuries seen
during examination of the cases, they
were either due to failed suicidal attempt
preceded the committed suicide, or self-
inflicted injuries including superficial
wounds and burns. 

Regarding signs of sexual or physical

Table (7) : Distribution of the studied suicidal cases in Alexandria governorate
(n=205) regarding the toxicological laboratory results.
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Table (9) : Distribution of the suicidal cases in Alexandria governorate (n= 205) re-
garding data related to forensic examination.

Table (10) : Relation between signs of sexual or physical abuse and gender.

Table (8) : Relation between suicidal note and method of suicide.
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difference in number of population, cultu-
ral and socioeconomic levels as well as the
possibility of underestimation of the num-
ber of suicides due to lack of adequate sur-
veillance and misclassification of suicide
as an accidental deaths.

The Arab police and government
records reported that the annual complet-
ed suicide rates of the countries of the
Eastern Mediterranean Region (EMR)
ranged from 1.1/100.000 to 6.2/100.000
(Hanna et al., 2011). This rate is lower than
that of countries like USA, UK, Canada,
and China which ranged from 11.5/
100,000 in USA to 23/100,000 in Canada
and China. This could be explained by the
good relations between family members
throughout the country, the religious na-
ture of the Egyptian people either muslim
or christian whose religions consider sui-
cide an offense towards Allah (Aboul-
Hagag et al., 2013). 

Okasha (2009) stated that suicidal be-
havior is affected by the cultural attitudes
towards suicide which is openly con-
demned in Islamic countries, a fact related
to its explicit prohibition in the Qur'an. El-
Fawal (1999) showed a relatively low aver-
age suicide rate (1.1/100,000 population
per annum) in his study in another Islamic
country; Saudi Arabia. This idea is sup-
ported by the work of Setenay et al. (2007)
who reported that religion plays a great
role, especially with respect to a belief in

DISCUSSION

The current study revealed that the
highest percentage of cases was recorded
in year 2010 (15.1%). This may refer to the
stress lied upon the Egyptian community
during this year just before the Egyptian
revolution. In fact, in 2011 after the Egyp-
tian revolution there was complete securi-
ty breakdown lasted for about one month
before the gradual recovery of police, and
during this period there may be unrecord-
ed cases of suicide or homicide which
have been buried without informing  the
police and without performing forensic
autopsy.

The average rate of suicide in the
present study was 1.02/100,000 popula-
tion. This rate exceeded that reported by
the WHO for Egypt in 1987, which was 0.1
for males and 0.0 for females per 100,000
persons. This may be explained by in-
creasing depression, social problems and
drug abuse among Egyptians. In addition,
this rate of suicide in Alexandria is higher
than that recorded in other studies in
Egypt e.g. Assuit, 0.55–0.81 for the period
2005–2009 (Abdel Moneim et al., 2012), So-
hag, 0.16–0.35 for the period 2005–2009
(Aboul-Hagag et al., 2013) Cairo, 0.47–0.74
/100.000 for the period 2003–2007 (Taha et
al., 2011), but lower than the rate reported
in Port Said, 1.66–2.41/100.000 for the pe-
riod 1998–2004 (Gad El-Hak et al., 2009).
This variation could be explained by the
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rates of suicide in females than in males,
especially in rural areas. This is explained
by the fact that females seek help for psy-
chological problems more than males. Fur-
thermore, Aboul-Hagag et al. (2013) re-
corded a higher rate of suicide among
females and explained it by the increasing
stress on females because of the traditions
like gender disparity, early age of mar-
riage, lack of autonomy to choose her
male partner, pressure to have a male off-
spring and subordinate role of females in
society with economic dependence on
husband which may generate feeling of
hopelessness and frustration together with
decreased chance of marriage in women
(spinsterhood), mainly in Upper Egypt.

The mean age of studied suicidal cases
was 30.73±10.43 years. This age distribu-
tion for males and females is the age of
youth and work and, in females, the age of
reproduction. This indicates the existence
of a problem: a decrease in the chance of
working (unemployment) and marriage
(spinsterhood). An additional factor that
may aggravate the state of depression in
youth, especially among men, is the in-
crease in drug abuse among youth, which
is difficult to explain: does the depression
lead them to use these drugs or does the
drug abuse increase depression?. Gad El-
Hak et al. (2009), Taha et al. (2011) and
Abdel Moneim et al. (2012) supported
these results in demonstrating that the
highest rate of suicide in Port Said  and

an afterlife, which averts feelings of hope-
lessness, a feeling that has been described
as an important predisposing factor for
suicide.

Males outnumbered females in all stud-
ied years. The predominance of male sui-
cide victims is consistent with the results
of Behera et al. (2005); Shields et al. (2005)
and Gad El-Hak et al. (2009) who recorded
that males were 2.7, 4.5, 2.07 times respec-
tively more prone to commit suicide than
females. It is hypothesized that males
have been socialized to act decisively in
their professional and personal lives with-
out sharing feelings of depression or suici-
dal ideation with others. On the other
hand, females discuss emotional concerns
with friends and family which may ease
the inherent disagreeable tensions (Shields
et al. 2005). In addition, there is higher in-
cidence of other risk factors among males,
e.g. availability of firearms, more financial
problems, difficulty in having a good job
opportunity and more incidence of drugs
of abuse.

On the contrary, Kaplan and Sadock
(1998) and Ajdacic-Gross et al. (2008) stat-
ed that females were four times more like-
ly to attempt suicide than males, utilize
methods of lower lethality as drug over-
dose or superficial incisions of wrists and
select a venue with a high likelihood of
discovery and rescue. Hawton (2000)
found that in china there were very high
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and police reports, this was most success-
ful in year 2011 (last year of retrospective
study) and the mission was harder in pre-
vious years leading to a small percentage
of missing data not exceeding 6 % such as
marital status (1.5%), history of drug
abuse (5.9%), history of alcohol abuse
(5.4%) and occupational history (5.3%).

The present study showed that the
highest percentage of suicide was among
single victims. Kposowa (2008) studied
suicide in England and Wales between
(1982-2005) and showed that the rate of
suicide was the lowest among married
people and the rate of suicide among sin-
gle and divorced people is three times
higher than married people. Marriage was
found to be a preventive factor in attempt-
ed suicide (Shirazi et al., 2012). It is possi-
ble that suicidal cases are underreported
or misclassified when they occur in fami-
lies with strong religious ties; it is also
possible that single females and males
have fewer ties and thus their suicides are
over-represented in these data.  

The majority of cases in the present
study were from urban areas as it is well
known that Alexandria is mainly an urban
community with a few numbers of villag-
es in the distant east and west parts of the
governorate. Literate and university grad-
uates outnumbered illiterate cases and this
coincides with Behera et al. (2005) and
Pompili et al. (2013) whose study revealed

Assuit; another cities in Egypt, was in the
age group of 20–30 years. It was noticed in
the current study that the suicide rate de-
creased as age increased among males and
females, which can be explained by the in-
crease in the level of responsibility of
males and females towards their families.
None of cases occurred at age below 15
years and this coincides with McClure
(1994) who stated that suicide is very un-
common in childhood and early adoles-
cence and there were no recorded suicides
in children under 10 years in the United
Kingdom between 1960 and 1990.

In the retrospective study, a problem in
collecting data was faced as the archive
does not include all required information
because although the memorandum of the
public prosecution sent to the directorate
of forensic medicine usually include the
personal data, history of the case and the
testimony of the relatives, but still in some
cases not all the required data were availa-
ble like the marital status, education, occu-
pation, and history of physical and sexual
abuse because most coroners and mem-
bers of the public prosecution used to ask
in cases of suicide only about the history
of psychological disease, alcohol and drug
abuse, previous suicidal attempts and if
the victim has enemies (to exclude any
criminal suspicion). So, collection of una-
vailable data was done through other
ways as the registration file of the mortu-
ary, permission of burial, death certificates
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bation of mood disorder, as manifested in
hospital admissions, mood disorder sever-
ity, electroconvulsive therapy use, and
worsening of depression scores (Goodwin
and Jamison, 2007; Postolache et al., 2010).
This could be explained by bioclimatic
theory: seasonal variation in bright light,
photoperiod, and other meteorological
variables, such as environmental tempera-
ture, may induce adverse changes in neu-
rotransmitter systems. Thereby, a rapid in-
crease in sunshine in spring might
increase suicidal tendencies in vulnerable
subjects. The neurotransmitters implicated
by the monoamine-deficiency theory of
mood regulation/dysregulation, such as
dopamine, norepinephrine, and serotonin,
are also neurotransmitters of thermoregu-
lation. Seasonal changes in neurotransmit-
ter systems have been previously report-
ed. For instance, Maes et al. (1995)
reported that plasma L-tryptophan, the
precursor of serotonin, a neurotransmitter
broadly implicated in depression and sui-
cide; has a trough in spring. Alternative
biological factors have been proposed as
triggers of suicide in spring, such as the
marked tree pollen peaks in spring (Post-
olache et al., 2005) which could result in
seasonally increased cytokine production
in upper airways resulting in increased ex-
acerbation of mood disturbance in spring
(Guzman et al., 2007).

The current study revealed that the
highest percentage of cases committed sui-

that individuals with higher educational
achievement may be more prone to sui-
cide risk when facing failures, public
shame and high premorbid functioning
than illiterate and less educated people.
Moreover, unemployed victims outnum-
bered employed ones. This is consistent
with Blakely et al. (2003) who stated that
there was an approximately two to three
folds excess risk of suicide among the un-
employed compared to the employed per-
sons and explained that by increased vul-
nerability and impact of stressful life  such
as mental illness and financial difficulties.

The majority of suicide  cases in the
present work occur indoor. This coincides
with Stack and Wasserman (2009) who
stated that the majority of suicide cases
commit suicide indoor and most of them
inside their bedrooms with an indoor to
outdoor ratio of 3.2:1. Lalwani et al. (2004)
found that the majority of victims commit-
ted suicide at their residence to provide an
easy access to all facilities required for
commitment of suicide without giving
time to reconsider the decision.

The highest percentage of cases oc-
curred during the spring months. This co-
incides with Bridges et al. (2005) and Taha
et al. (2011). The seasonal spring peak of
suicide was reported in many previous
studies, and it is a highly replicated epi-
demiological feature of suicide. A peak in
spring has also been reported for exacer-
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among males. Moreover, Brock and Grif-
fiths (2003) showed that even in England
and Wales, hanging is the commonest
method of suicide especially among
males, accounting for 2000 deaths each
year. This may be explained by that hang-
ing is a very simple and highly effective
suicidal method. Also, the materials re-
quired are easily available, and a wide
range of ligatures can be used.

Taha et al. (2011) studied suicidal death
in Cairo. They stated that the most com-
monly used method of suicide among fe-
males was burning which represented
43% of cases, followed by falling from
height which represented 28%, which is
not too far from the results of the present
study.

In the present work, the total number of
cases of suicide by firearm was 14 cases
(6.8%), 12 males and two females. This co-
incides with Romero and Wintmute (2002)
who mentioned that even in USA the rate
of suicide by firearm among males is
much higher than females with a male to
female ratio of 6.5:1. On the contrary,
Shields et al. (2005) recorded that suicide
by firearm was the preferred method ei-
ther in males or females, accounting for
67.5% of cases and this may be attributed
to high rates of household firearm owner-
ship in USA.

Out of 12 males committed suicide by

cide by hanging. Nikolic et al. (2003) stat-
ed that hanging is the commonest method
of suicide in developing countries. This is
consistent with Hanna et al. (2011) study
in Lybia and Al-Madni et al. (2010) in
Saudi Arabia, Dammam. They recorded
that firearms, self-burning and falling
from height were the next most common
methods of suicide after hanging. The
most common toxin used for suicide in the
present study was organophosphates. This
coincides with studies of Abdel Moneim
et al. (2012) and Gad El-Hak et al. (2009) in
Egypt and may be attributed to the availa-
bility and cheap price of organophos-
phates.

The commonest method used by males
was hanging (n=70) which reflects a high-
er degree of autoaggressive behavior, fol-
lowed by falling from height and burning
(n=22 for each), while the highest percent-
age of females committed suicide by fall-
ing from height (36%), followed by burn-
ing (34%) then self poisoning (20%). This
could be explained by the differences in
personality characteristics between men
and women, as men mostly choose more
violent methods of suicide.

These results coincide with Ajdacic-
Gross et al. (2008) who reported the meth-
ods of suicide in different countries ac-
cording to the WHO mortality database
finding in 2006.  It was found that hanging
was the most frequent cause of suicide
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in 2.9% of cases (83.3% of them were
males). This coincides with Borges et al.
(2006) who reported that alcohol and drug
abusers have higher rates of suicide than
other people; and they found that 2.4% of
those who are consuming alcohol and
drugs have previous suicidal attempts,
while only 0.78% of non alcohol or drug
abusers have previous suicidal attempts,
and they stated that policies designed to
reduce the consumption of alcohol and il-
legal drugs may succeed in reducing suici-
dal behaviors. The major risk factors for
suicide among alcoholics are: current
drinking, major depression, suicidal
thoughts, loss of support from family and
friends, living alone, and unemployment
(Martin et al., 2012). Positive postmortem
toxicological screen for addicting drugs
was detected in 14.6% of victims in the
study of Taha et al. (2011) in Cairo.

The present results showed that 20% of
suicide victims had previous suicide at-
tempts. Chang et al. (2011) stated that ap-
proximately 20% of suicides have had pre-
vious attempts and of those who have
attempted suicide 1% commit suicide
within a year and more than 5% commit
suicide after 10 years, so they consider
that a history of previous suicide attempts
is the greatest predictor of eventual com-
pletion of suicide.

Suicidal notes were present in 3.4% of
suicide cases in the current work and

firearm, 8 were soldiers in armed forces
and police forces and committed suicide
while on duty or just after the duty inside
the military camp and used the official
firearm. Martin et al. (2005) stated that
firearm suicide accounted for 53% of the
total number of cases of suicide among
Irish military personnel and this can be ex-
plained by the easy access to the lethal
weapon which suggests that significant
factors in workplace suicide include op-
portunity to use lethal means in occupa-
tional settings.

Psychic troubles were present in 38% of
cases of suicide in the current study.
Shields et al. (2005) stated that risk factors
for a completed suicide include male sex,
and psychiatric disorders. This coincides
with Kutcher and Chehil (2012). They
found that mental disorders are often
present at the time of suicide with esti-
mates ranging from 27% to more than
90%, half of all people who die by suicide
may have major depressive disorder or
one of the other mood disorders such as
bipolar disorder which increases the risk
of suicide 20-fold.

The present findings showed that 12.7%
of cases had history of alcohol abuse and
10.2% of them had history of drug abuse,
also toxicological analysis of samples tak-
en during autopsy show positive results
for alcohol in 4.4% of cases (all of them
were males) and positive results for drugs
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had attempted suicide one or more times
in their lives and were significantly more
likely to commit suicide after that. 

The present study revealed that signs of
severe illness were present in 3.9% of sui-
cide victims. History from relatives refer
to that some of them committed suicide
because of severe chronic pain and feeling
of dependence on others, because they
cannot afford the high cost of treatment
and this coincides with Taha et al. (2011)
who stated that chronic medical illness
has been identified as a motivating factor
in approximately 25% of all suicides and
the percentages rise with age. Pain may be
a primary reason as approximately
20–30% of suicides result from depression
and high rates of depression occurs in
many chronically painful conditions. This
is also, consistent with the results of Behe-
ra et al. (2005), who reported that 16.4% of
suicidal cases suffered from chronic pain-
ful illness at the time of committing sui-
cides.

CONCLUSION

Diagnosis of suicide may be difficult in
some cases, where the victim's family may
alter the scene or fabricate a story for the
event in an effort to avoid the social stig-
ma, guilt or loss of insurance benefits. A
multifaceted investigation is warranted in
suspicious suicide to explore and support
the self-inflicted and intentional nature of

there was no statistical significant associa-
tion between presence of suicidal note and
methods of suicide. This coincides with Ei-
senwort et al. (2006) whose study revealed
that suicide victims who leave suicide
notes do not differ statistically from non-
note-leavers in sex, age, family status, psy-
chiatric care, motive, or method.

In the current study, 20% of females
had menses while committing suicide.
This is consistent with the results of Behe-
ra et al. (2005), where 30% of female vic-
tims were in the period of menstruation at
the time of committing  suicide. In fe-
males, the proportion of suicide attempt-
ers due to psychological  disorders asso-
ciated with menses (premenstrual
syndrome, menstrual psychosis)  is  signif-
icantly higher than the  expected  prob-
ability in the general population  (Hatota-
ni et al., 1986).

The present findings showed that signs
of sexual abuse were present in 1.5% of
suicide victims. Moreover, signs of physi-
cal abuse were present in 5.4%. Brickman
and Briere (1998) stated that sexual abuse
victims often experience guilt and self-
blame along with low self-esteem especial-
ly if during the abuse, the victim incorpo-
rates responsibility for the act, or sees him-
self/herself as "deserving it" possibly as a
response to the stigmatization and inter-
nalized negative evaluation, all that make
over 50% of sexually abused crisis clients
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دراسـة طبيـة شرعية عـن الانتحـار بالإسكندرية

اĠشتركون فى البحث

د. نعيمـة عبد الحليم شريـف                 د. منـــال حســن عبــد العزيـز 
د. أسمـــاء سعـــيد البنـــــا                 د. محمد مصطفى عبد القادر*

من قسم الطب الشرعى والسموم الاكلينيكية - كليـة الطب - جامعـة الإسكندريـة

ومصلحـة الطـب الشرعـى بالإسكندريـة*

الانتحار فى اĠـصريě موضوع ذو أهمية عظيمة ويحتاج إلى دراسة شاملـة لتشكيل خطة Ġنع حدوثه وكان الهدف من هذا العمل دراسة حجم

مشكلة الانـتحار بالإسكندرية. الدراسة اشتـملت على جزأين وهما دراسة مرجعية وأخـذت بياناتها من التقارير الطـبية الشرعية لحالات الانتحار

المحولـة إلى مصلـحة الطب الـشرعي بالإسكـندرية للـتشريح أثـناء فترة أربـع سنوات (من أول ينـاير ٢٠٠٨ وحتى نـهاية ديسـمبر ٢٠١١) والجزء

الثانى دراسة مستقـبلية وتضمنت كل حـالات الانتحار المحولة إلى مصلـحة الطب الشرعي بالإسكـندرية للتشريح أثـناء فترة ستة أشهر (من أول

يناير ٢٠١٢ وحتى يونيو ٢٠١٢).

كـان العـدد الكـلى لحالات الانـتحـار ٢٠٥ حالـة ومثـلت ١١٫٥%  من حالات الـتشـريح وأعلى نـسبـة ١٥٫١% قد سـجلت فـي سنة ٢٠١٠.

وكان معدل الانتحار يتراوح بـě ٠٫٨٨  و ١٫٠٩ لكل ١٠٠٠٠٠ نسمة Ėتوسط ١٫٠٢ لكل ١٠٠٠٠٠ نسمة. كان غالبية الحالات من الرجال

(٧٥٫٦) وأعلى نـسـبة كـانت فى الفـئة الـعمـرية من  ٢١ - ٣٠ سـنة فى كلا الجـنسـě ومثـلت (٤٩٫٣%) من مجـموع الحـالات. أكثـر الحالات

كـانت في اĠنـاطق الحـضريـة (٩٤٫١%) و بě اĠـتـعلـمě (٨٨٫٨%) وذوى الـبطـالـة (٥٧٫١%) والغـير مـتـزوجě (٤٩٫٣%). كـان الانتـحار

بالشنق أكثـر الطرق شيوعا بě الرجال  (٤٥٫١٦%) بينما السقوط من أعلى كـان أكثر الطرق شيوعا بě الـنساء. أغلب الوفيات من الانتحار

حدثت فى الـربيع (٣٦٫١%) وبـداخل الأماكن اĠـغلـقة (٦٥٫٩%) ورصـدت اĠشـاكل النـفسـية في ٣٨% من الحـالات وكان ٢٠%  من الحالات

لهم محاولات سابقة للإنتحار.

نسـتنـتج من هذه الـدراسة أن مـعدل الانـتحـار في الإسكـندريـة أقل بكـثيـر من أماكن أخـرى. لكن مـازالت تعـتبـر مشـكلـة لابد من إعـطاءها

الأولويـة تجاه منعهـا وأن طرق الانتحار في مـتناول الأيدي في كل مكـان ومن الصعب حظرهـاĒ لذا خطط منع الانتـحار اĠبنيـة على عوامل الخطر

من اĠمكن أن تكون أكثر فاعلية من حجب الوصول لتلك الطرق.


